

## Payne & Fears Co., LPA

Client A  
892 Flatfee Drive  
Westerville, Ohio 43081

Date: January 31, 2014

Re: A v. A (Divorce, Case No. 13 DV 09432)

Invoice No.: A-001

| Date                              | Description  | Lawyer | Hours<br>(\$100/hr) | Amount   |
|-----------------------------------|--|--------|---------------------|----------|
| 12/1/2013                         | Initial Consultation, Sign Fee Agreement, Review Pre-Nuptial Agreement | SP     | 1.5                 | NC       |
| 12/7/2013                         | Call to opposing counsel, exchange several emails with client          | SP     | 0.5                 | \$50.00  |
| 12/11/2013                        | Draft Divorce Complaint, Meeting with client, review financials        | SP     | 1.5                 | \$150.00 |
| 12/29/2013                        | Text message to client, research                                       | SP     | 0.5                 | \$50.00  |
| 1/15/2014                         | Meet with client   | SP     | 1                   | \$100.00 |
| <b>Total Hours/Fees</b>           |  |        | 5                   | \$350.00 |
| <b>Carryover Trust Balance</b>    |  |        |                     | \$0.00   |
| <b>Payments Received</b>          |  |        |                     | \$800.00 |
| - \$200 (12/15/13)                |  |        |                     |          |
| - \$600 (12/31/13)                |  |        |                     |          |
| <b>Costs and Expenses</b>         |  |        |                     | \$220.00 |
| - \$220 (filing fee on 1/19/14)   |  |        |                     |          |
| <b>BALANCE DUE NOW</b>            |  |        |                     | \$0.00   |
| <b>Balance Remaining in Trust</b> |  |        |                     | \$230.00 |

Telephone: 614-123-8765

Facsimile: 614-123-8764

115A Waiver Way, Gahanna, Ohio 43230

## Payne & Fears Co., LPA

Client A  
892 Flatfee Drive  
Westerville, Ohio 43081

Date: February 28, 2014

Re: A v. A (Divorce, Case No. 13 DV 09432)

Invoice No.: A-002

| <b>Date</b>  | <b>Description</b>       | <b>Lawyer</b> | <b>Hours<br/>(\$100/hr)</b> | <b>Amount</b> |
|--|--------------------------|---------------|-----------------------------|---------------|
| 2/12/2014  | First Pre-Trial          | SP            | 1                           | \$100.00      |
| 2/13/2014  | Call to Client           | SP            | 0.5                         | \$50.00       |
| 2/27/2014  | Draft Motion to Continue | SP            | 0.25                        | \$25.00       |
| <b>Total Hours/Fees</b>                                    |                          |               | 1.75                        | \$175.00      |
| <b>Carryover Trust Balance</b>                             |                          |               |                             | \$230.00      |
| <b>Payments Received</b><br>- \$400 (2/1/14)               |                          |               |                             | \$400.00      |
| <b>Costs and Expenses</b><br>- \$5.00 (postage on 2/10/14) |                          |               |                             | \$5.00        |
| <b>BALANCE DUE NOW</b>                                     |                          |               |                             | \$0.00        |
| <b>Balance Remaining in Trust</b>                          |                          |               |                             | \$450.00      |

Telephone: 614-123-8765

Facsimile: 614-123-8764

115A Waiver Way, Gahanna, Ohio 43230

## Payne & Fears Co., LPA

Client A  
892 Flatfee Drive  
Westerville, Ohio 43081

Date: March 30, 2014

Re: A v. A (Divorce, Case No. 13 DV 09432)

Invoice No.: A-003

| <b>Date</b>                       | <b>Description</b>  | <b>Lawyer</b> | <b>Hours<br/>(\$100/hr)</b> | <b>Amount</b> |
|-----------------------------------|---|---------------|-----------------------------|---------------|
| 3/11/2014                         | Final Pre-Trial   | SP            | 2                           | \$200.00      |
| 3/13/2014                         | Meeting with Client, review<br>correspondence, email to opposing<br>counsel, draft separation agreement | SP            | 1.5                         | \$150.00      |
| 3/27/2014                         | Final Divorce Trial, Meeting with client  | SP            | 1                           | \$100.00      |
| <b>Total Hours/Fees</b>           |   |               | 4.5                         | \$450.00      |
| <b>Carryover Trust Balance</b>    |   |               |                             | \$450.00      |
| <b>Payments Received</b>          |   |               |                             | \$0.00        |
| <b>Costs and Expenses</b>         |   |               |                             |               |
| <b>BALANCE DUE NOW</b>            |   |               |                             | \$0.00        |
| <b>Balance Remaining in Trust</b> |   |               |                             | \$0.00        |

Telephone: 614-123-8765

Facsimile: 614-123-8764

115A Waiver Way, Gahanna, Ohio 43230

## Payne & Fears Co., LPA

Client C  
675 Overdraft Circle  
Columbus, Ohio 43215

Date: February 28, 2014

Re: C v. C (Divorce, Case No. 14 DV 11458)

Invoice No.: C-001

| <b>Date</b>  | <b>Description</b>   | <b>Lawyer</b> | <b>Hours<br/>(\$200/hr)</b> | <b>Amount</b> |
|--|--|---------------|-----------------------------|---------------|
| 2/3/2014   | Initial Consultation, Letter of Representation to Opposing Counsel, Research   | SP            | 1                           | \$200.00      |
| 2/8/2014   | Draft Divorce Complaint, Separation Agreement, and Shared Parenting Plan       | SP            | 2                           | \$400.00      |
| 2/16/2014  | Meeting with Client, Sign documents, email to opposing counsel, file complaint | SP            | 0.5                         | \$100.00      |
| <b>Total Hours/Fees</b>                                      |  |               | 3.5                         | \$700.00      |
| <b>Carryover Trust Balance</b>                               |  |               |                             | \$0.00        |
| <b>Payments Received</b><br>- \$200 (Filing fee on 2/11/14)  |  |               |                             | \$200.00      |
| <b>Costs and Expenses</b><br>- \$200 (Filing fee on 2/16/14) |  |               |                             | \$200.00      |
| <b>BALANCE DUE NOW</b>                                       |  |               |                             | \$700.00      |
| <b>Balance Remaining in Trust</b>                            |  |               |                             | \$0.00        |

Telephone: 614-123-8765

Facsimile: 614-123-8764

115A Waiver Way, Gahanna, Ohio 43230

## Payne & Fears Co., LPA

Client C  
675 Overdraft Circle  
Columbus, Ohio 43215

Date: March 30, 2014

Re: C v. C (Divorce, Case No. 14 DV 11458)

Invoice No.: C-002

| Date                              | Description                              | Lawyer | Hours<br>(\$200/hr) | Amount     |
|-----------------------------------|--|--------|---------------------|------------|
| 3/14/2014                         | First Pre-Trial                          | SP     | 2                   | \$400.00   |
| 3/15/2014                         | Call to opposing counsel, call to client | SP     | 0.5                 | \$100.00   |
| <b>Total Hours/Fees</b>           |  |        | 2.5                 | \$500.00   |
| <b>Prior Balance</b>              |  |        |                     | \$700.00   |
| <b>Carryover Trust Balance</b>    |  |        |                     | \$0.00     |
| <b>Payments Received</b>          |  |        |                     | \$2,000.00 |
| - \$2,000 (3/26/14)               |  |        |                     |            |
| <b>Costs and Expenses</b>         |  |        |                     | \$0.00     |
| <b>BALANCE DUE NOW</b>            |  |        |                     | \$0.00     |
| <b>Balance Remaining in Trust</b> |  |        |                     | \$800.00   |

Telephone: 614-123-8765

Facsimile: 614-123-8764

115A Waiver Way, Gahanna, Ohio 43230

## Payne & Fears Co., LPA

Client C  
675 Overdraft Circle  
Columbus, Ohio 43215

Date: April 30, 2014

Re: C v. C (Divorce, Case No. 14 DV 11458)

Invoice No.: C-003

| Date  | Description  | Lawyer | Hours<br>(\$200/hr) | Amount    |
|---|--|--------|---------------------|-----------|
| 4/11/2014   | Review Correspondence from<br>opposing counsel   | SP     | 0.25                | \$50.00   |
| 4/12/2014   | Letter to client re GAL appointments,<br>call to opposing counsel, text message<br>from client |        | 0.25                | \$50.00   |
| 4/19/2014   | Meeting with client  | SP     | 0.5                 | \$100.00  |
| <b>Total Hours/Fees</b>   |  |        | 1                   | \$200.00  |
| <b>Prior Balance</b>  |  |        |                     | \$0.00    |
| <b>Carryover Trust Balance</b>                                    |  |        |                     | \$800.00  |
| <b>Payments Received</b>  |  |        |                     | \$0.00    |
| <b>Costs and Expenses</b><br>-\$325.50 (Expert Report on 4/26/14) |  |        |                     | -\$325.50 |
| <b>BALANCE DUE NOW</b>  |  |        |                     | \$0.00    |
| <b>Balance Remaining in Trust</b>                                 |  |        |                     | \$274.50  |

Telephone: 614-123-8765

Facsimile: 614-123-8764

115A Waiver Way, Gahanna, Ohio 43230

## Payne & Fears Co., LPA

Client G  
1777 Compliance Sq.  
Hilliard, Ohio 43026

Date: February 28, 2014

Re: G v. R (Post Decree, Child Custody Visitation)

Invoice No.: G-001

| <b>Date</b>                       | <b>Description</b>   | <b>Lawyer</b> | <b>Hours<br/>(\$200/hr)</b> | <b>Amount</b> |
|-----------------------------------|--|---------------|-----------------------------|---------------|
| 2/7/2014                          | Initial Meeting With Client  | SP            | 2                           | NC            |
| 2/11/2014                         | In Depth Review of 7/11 Divorce Decree and Related Documents                             | SP            | 3                           | \$600.00      |
| 2/12/2014                         | Email to client, Email to opposing counsel, file NOA, file request for change of custody | SP            | 1.5                         | \$300.00      |
| 2/13/2014                         | Draft affidavit for client's signature   | SP            | 0.5                         | \$100.00      |
| 2/18/2014                         | Court Appearance, meeting with opposing counsel and GAL                                  | SP            | 3.5                         | \$700.00      |
| 2/19/2014                         | Follow-up meeting with client  | SP            | 1                           | \$200.00      |
| <b>Total Hours/Fees</b>           |  |               | 11.5                        | \$1,900.00    |
| <b>Prior Balance</b>              |  |               |                             | \$0.00        |
| <b>Carryover Trust Balance</b>    |  |               |                             | \$0.00        |
| <b>Payments Received</b>          |  |               |                             | \$1,000.00    |
| - \$1,000 (2/7/14)                |  |               |                             |               |
| <b>Costs and Expenses</b>         |  |               |                             | \$100.00      |
| - \$100 Filing Fee (2/12/14)      |  |               |                             |               |
| <b>BALANCE DUE NOW</b>            |  |               |                             | \$1,000.00    |
| <b>Balance Remaining in Trust</b> |  |               |                             | \$0.00        |

Telephone: 614-123-8765

Facsimile: 614-123-8764

115A Waiver Way, Gahanna, Ohio 43230

## Payne & Fears Co., LPA

Client G  
1777 Compliance Sq.  
Hilliard, Ohio 43026

Date: March 30, 2014

Re: G v. R (Post Decree, Child Custody Visitation)

Invoice No.: G-002

| <b>Date</b>                                    | <b>Description</b>                                    | <b>Lawyer</b> | <b>Hours<br/>(\$200/hr)</b> | <b>Amount</b> |
|--|---|---------------|-----------------------------|---------------|
| 3/1/2014                                       | Telephone call from client                            | SP            | 0.25                        | \$50.00       |
| 3/15/2014                                      | Call to Opposing Counsel                              | SP            | 0.5                         | \$100.00      |
| 3/16/2014                                      | Research  | SP            | 0.5                         | \$100.00      |
| 3/28/2014                                      | Draft Motion for Contempt and<br>Supporting Affidavit | SP            | 0.25                        | \$50.00       |
| <b>Total Hours/Fees</b>                        |   |               | 1.5                         | \$300.00      |
| <b>Prior Balance</b>                           |   |               |                             | \$1,000.00    |
| <b>Carryover Trust Balance</b>                 |   |               |                             | \$0.00        |
| <b>Payments Received</b><br>- \$2,500 (3/5/14) |   |               |                             | \$2,500.00    |
| <b>Costs and Expenses</b>                      |   |               |                             | \$0.00        |
| <b>BALANCE DUE NOW</b>                         |   |               |                             | \$0.00        |
| <b>Balance Remaining in Trust</b>              |   |               |                             | \$1,200.00    |

Telephone: 614-123-8765

Facsimile: 614-123-8764

115A Waiver Way, Gahanna, Ohio 43230